

**Paths to QUALITY
Staff File Checklist**

Date Ranges: 9/1/10 through 9/1/11

Staff Name	Date of Hire	TEACH Recipient	Date of Foundations Training	Current Level of Education	Number of In-service Hours	Number of College/University Hours
1 Deb Hughes, Director	6/5/1989		3/7/2008	BS Social Work	7.75	0
2 Laura Auer	9/15/2005	Y	9/8/2008	Ivy Tech for AS	27.75	6
3 Amy Blissett	3/24/2004	Y	9/8/2008	Ivy Tech for AS	20.75	3
4 Tonya Born	1/18/2006		9/30/2008	BS ED K/EC cert.	27	0
5 Donita Brandenburg	8/18/2005		9/3/2008	CDA	22.25	0
6 Lynn Cabral	1/31/2011		7/18/2011	Assistant Teacher	36.5	0
7 Joy Clark	11/18/1977		8/28/2009	CDA	65	0
8 Jean Clifton	9/2/1975		9/30/2008	MS ED/Kindergarten	25.75	0
9 Brandy Cooper				CDA	1	0
10 Erin Cress	6/8/2011		1/22/2011	AS ECE	8.5	0
11 Karen Henderson	11/3/2008		7/28/2009	AS ECE	24.75	0
12 Esther Hoya	9/21/2005		9/3/08 & 7/28/09	CDA	12.75	0
13 Jessica Knox	3/7/2011	Y	5/23/2010	Ivy Tech for AS	25.25	16
14 Karlee Knox	1/7/2010		5/25/2010	Ivy Tech for AS	27.25	6
15 Ryan Mays	8/12/2002		9/10/2008	CDA	39.75	0
16 Madison McCloskey					7.75	0
17 Griselda Palma	10/23/2006	Y	9/10/2008	CDA	21	3
18 Janelle Reid	10/8/2008		9/25/2009	CDA Hours	16.5	0
19 Erin Shock	3/3/2011		5/18/2011	Enrolling at Ivy Tech soon	39.75	0
20 Nicole Sicard	8/23/1999	Y	9/8/2008	Ivy Tech for AS	22.5	14
21 Denise Skibinski	4/3/1997		9/8/08 & 7/28/09	CDA	28.5	0
22 Chris Tam-Akins	9/12/1979		9/10/2008	CDA	58	0
23 Cheryl Thomas	1/31/2000	Y	9/3/2008	Ivy Tech for AS	22.25	9
24 Kiley Vitek	9/24/2011		5/18/2011	AS ECE	42	0
25 Shayla Williams	2/3/2011		2/5/2009	CDA	37	0
26 Darla Zirkelbach	1/6/1992	Y	9/10/2008	Ivy Tech for AS	19	11

LAST UPDATED: 8/1/2011

Education_Hours_Query 11

Last Name	First Name	Date	Conf.	Credits	Name of Class	Location	Total Conf. Hours	Total Credit Hours				
Auer	Laura	9/1/2010		3	HIST 101 Survey of American History I	Ivy Tech	27.75	6				
		9/20/2010	1.25		Review State and Paths to Quality Requirements	Kiddie Prep School						
		11/18/2010	0.75		Communication at Kiddie Prep School	Kiddie Prep School						
		11/18/2010	0.75		"You Pick It" - Updates to Help Team Run Efficiently	Kiddie Prep School						
		12/1/2010	1.75		Neurodevelopment, Reflexes and Learning 2	Kiddie Prep School						
		12/2/2010	1.75		One-Minute Classroom Exercises and Transitional Activities	Kiddie Prep School						
		1/1/2011		3	ECE 130 Developmentally Appropriate Guidelines in a Cultural Context	Ivy Tech						
		1/6/2011	0.75		Technology Rmeinders to Improve Parent Teacher Communication	Kiddie Prep School						
		1/20/2011	0.75		Going Back to Basics for Quality Care	Kiddie Prep School						
		2/18/2011	0.75		Review Teachers' Suggestions	Kiddie Prep School						
		3/3/2011	0.75		Preparing for Neurodevelopment	Kiddie Prep School						
		3/11/2011	1.75		Neurodevelopment: Foundations for Development & Learning	Kiddie Prep School						
		3/11/2011	1.75		Auditory Integration Training	Kiddie Prep School						
		3/22/2011	1		The Development of Visually Impaired Students	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/17/2011	0.75		Child Abuse & Neglect Indicators	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/18/2011	1.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #1 Unsalty Salt	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/19/2011	1.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #2 The Biblical Foundation of Prayer	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/20/2011	1		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #3 Above All Else	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/24/2011	1.25		Preparing Teachers: #4 Moving the Hand of God-The Holy Spirit	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/25/2011	1		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #5 Holy Heat	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/26/2011	1.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #6 Prayer, Holiness, and Fire	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/27/2011	0.75		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #7 Beauty for Ashes	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/31/2011	1		CPR Certification	Kiddie Prep School						
		6/2/2011	2.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #8 Q&A with Pastors and Prayer	Kiddie Prep School						
		6/3/2011	1.25		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #9 Fight Fire with Fire	Kiddie Prep School						
		Blissett	Amy	9/22/2010	1.25				Review State and Paths to Quality Requirements	Kiddie Prep School	20.75	3
				10/5/2010	2				Building Blocks for Families	United Way Agency		
				10/7/2010	0.25				Computer Frustrations	Kiddie Prep School		
10/7/2010	0.5				Communication with Parents/Laptops	Kiddie Prep School						
11/18/2010	0.75				Communication at Kiddie Prep School	Kiddie Prep School						
11/18/2010	0.75				"You Pick It" - Updates to Help Team Run Efficiently	Kiddie Prep School						
11/29/2010	1.75				Auditory Integration Training	Kiddie Prep School						
11/30/2010	1.75				Neurodevelopment, Reflexes and Learning 1	Kiddie Prep School						
1/6/2011	0.75				Technology Rmeinders to Improve Parent Teacher Communication	Kiddie Prep School						
1/20/2011	0.75				Going Back to Basics for Quality Care	Kiddie Prep School						
2/18/2011	0.75				Review Teachers' Suggestions	Kiddie Prep School						
3/3/2011	0.75				Preparing for Neurodevelopment	Kiddie Prep School						
3/22/2011	1				The Development of Visually Impaired Students	Kiddie Prep School						
5/17/2011	0.75				Child Abuse & Neglect Indicators	Kiddie Prep School						
6/30/2011	1.5				Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #2 The Biblical Foundation of Prayer	Kiddie Prep School						
7/7/2011	1				Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #3 Above All Else	Kiddie Prep School						
7/14/2011	1.25				Preparing Teachers: #4 Moving the Hand of God-The Holy Spirit	Kiddie Prep School						
7/20/2011	1				Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #5 Holy Heat	Kiddie Prep School						
7/27/2011	1.5				Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #6 Prayer, Holiness, and Fire	Kiddie Prep School						
8/3/2011	0.75				Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #7 Beauty for Ashes	Kiddie Prep School						
9/1/2011				3	IVYT 120: New Student Seminar	Ivy Tech						

Education_Hours_Query 11

Last Name	First Name	Date	Conf.	Credits	Name of Class	Location	Total Conf. Hours	Total Credit Hours				
Born	Tonya	9/22/2010	1.25		Review State and Paths to Quality Requirements	Kiddie Prep School	27	0				
		10/5/2010	2		Bullding Blocks for Families	United Way Agency						
		10/7/2010	0.25		Computer Frustrations	Kiddie Prep School						
		10/7/2010	0.5		Communication with Parents/Laptops	Kiddie Prep School						
		11/18/2010	0.75		"You Pick It" - Updates to Help Team Run Effeciently	Kiddie Prep School						
		11/18/2010	0.75		Communication at Kiddie Prep School	Kiddie Prep School						
		11/29/2010	1.75		Auditory Integration Training	Kiddie Prep School						
		11/30/2010	1.75		Neurodevelopment, Reflexes and Learning 1	Kiddie Prep School						
		12/2/2010	1.75		One-Minute Classroom Exercises and Transitional Activities	Kiddie Prep School						
		1/6/2011	0.75		Technology Rmeinders to Improve Parent Teacher Communication	Kiddie Prep School						
		2/18/2011	0.75		Review Teachers' Suggestions	Kiddie Prep School						
		3/3/2011	0.75		Preparing for Neurodevelopment	Kiddie Prep School						
		3/22/2011	1		The Development of Visually Impaired Students	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/17/2011	0.75		Child Abuse & Neglect Indicators	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/18/2011	1.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #1 Unsalty Salt	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/19/2011	1.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #2 The Biblical Foundation of Prayer	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/20/2011	1		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #3 Above All Else	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/24/2011	1.25		Preparing Teachers: #4 Moving the Hand of God-The Holy Spirit	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/26/2011	1.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #6 Prayer, Holiness, and Fire	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/26/2011	1		CPR Certification	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/27/2011	0.75		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #7 Beauty for Ashes	Kiddie Prep School						
		6/2/2011	2.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #8 Q&A with Pastors and Prayer	Kiddie Prep School						
		6/3/2011	1.25		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #9 Fight Fire with Fire	Kiddie Prep School						
		Brandenburg	Donita	9/22/2010	1.25				Review State and Paths to Quality Requirements	Kiddie Prep School	22.25	0
				10/7/2010	0.5				Communication with Parents/Laptops	Kiddie Prep School		
				10/7/2010	0.25				Computer Frustrations	Kiddie Prep School		
				11/18/2010	0.75				"You Pick It" - Updates to Help Team Run Effeciently	Kiddie Prep School		
11/18/2010	0.75				Communication at Kiddie Prep School	Kiddie Prep School						
12/1/2010	1.75				Neurodevelopment, Reflexes and Learning 2	Kiddie Prep School						
12/2/2010	1.75				One-Minute Classroom Exercises and Transitional Activities	Kiddie Prep School						
1/6/2011	0.75				Technology Rmeinders to Improve Parent Teacher Communication	Kiddie Prep School						
1/20/2011	0.75				Going Back to Basics for Quality Care	Kiddie Prep School						
2/18/2011	0.75				Review Teachers' Suggestions	Kiddie Prep School						
3/3/2011	0.75				Preparing for Neurodevelopment	Kiddie Prep School						
3/17/2011	1.75				Neurodevelopment: Foundation for Development & Learning	Kiddie Prep School						
3/17/2011	1.75				Auditory Integration Training	Kiddie Prep School						
3/22/2011	1				The Development of Visually Impaired Students	Kiddie Prep School						
5/17/2011	0.75				Child Abuse & Neglect Indicators	Kiddie Prep School						
6/23/2011	1.5				Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #1 Unsalty Salt	Kiddie Prep School						
6/30/2011	1.5				Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #2 Biblical Foundation of Prayer	Kiddie Prep School						
7/7/2011	1				Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #3 Above All Else	Kiddie Prep School						
7/14/2011	1.25				Preparing Teachers: #4 Moving the Hand of God-The Holy Spirit	Kiddie Prep School						
7/20/2011	1				Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #5 Holy Heat	Kiddie Prep School						
8/3/2011	0.75		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #7 Beauty for Ashes	Kiddie Prep School								

Education_Hours_Query 11

Last Name	First Name	Date	Conf.	Credits	Name of Class	Location	Total Conf. Hours	Total Credit Hours
Cabral	Lynn	2/3/2011	1		First Aid Certification	Kiddie Prep School	36.5	0
		2/7/2011	2.25		New Staff Child Development Video #1: Units 1-4	Kiddie Prep School		
		2/7/2011	2.25		New Staff Child Development Video #2: Units 5-9	Kiddie Prep School		
		2/8/2011	2.25		New Staff Child Development Video #3: Units 10-13	Kiddie Prep School		
		2/11/2011	2.25		New Staff Child Development Video #4: Units 14-17	Kiddie Prep School		
		2/15/2011	2.25		New Staff Child Development Video #5: Units 18-21	Kiddie Prep School		
		2/15/2011	0.5		CACFP Training	Kiddie Prep School		
		2/15/2011	0.5		Annual Notice of The KPS Personnel Policy Manual	Kiddie Prep School		
		2/15/2011	1		Teacher Handbook Training	Kiddie Prep School		
		2/16/2011	0.75		Child Abuse & Neglect Indicators	Kiddie Prep School		
		2/16/2011	2.25		New Staff Child Development Video #6: Units 22-26	Kiddie Prep School		
		2/17/2011	1.5		New Staff Child Development Video #7: Units 27-30	Kiddie Prep School		
		2/18/2011	0.75		Review Teachers' Suggestions	Kiddie Prep School		
		2/23/2011	3		KPS Training Manual	Kiddie Prep School		
		3/3/2011	0.75		Preparing for Neurodevelopment	Kiddie Prep School		
		3/22/2011	1		The Development of Visually Impaired Students	Kiddie Prep School		
		5/17/2011	0.75		Child Abuse & Neglect Indicators	Kiddie Prep School		
		6/22/2011	1.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #1 Unsalty Salt	Kiddie Prep School		
		6/29/2011	1.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #2 The Biblical Foundation of Prayer	Kiddie Prep School		
		7/7/2011	1		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #3 Above All Else	Kiddie Prep School		
		7/14/2011	1.25		Preparing Teachers: #4 Moving the Hand of God-The Holy Spirit	Kiddie Prep School		
		7/18/2011	3		Foundations Training	Kiddie Prep School		
		7/20/2011	1		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #5 Holy Heat	Kiddie Prep School		
		7/28/2011	1.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #6 Prayer, Holiness, and Fire	Kiddie Prep School		
		8/3/2011	0.75		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #7 Beauty for Ashes	Kiddie Prep School		

Education_Hours_Query 11

Last Name	First Name	Date	Conf.	Credits	Name of Class	Location	Total Conf. Hours	Total Credit Hours
Clark	Joy	9/20/2010	1.25		Review State and Paths to Quality Requirements	Kiddie Prep School	65	0
		10/7/2010	0.25		Computer Frustrations	Kiddie Prep School		
		10/7/2010	0.5		Communication with Parents/Laptops	Kiddie Prep School		
		11/18/2010	0.75		"You Pick It" - Updates to Help Team Run Efficiently	Kiddie Prep School		
		11/18/2010	0.75		Communication at Kiddie Prep School	Kiddie Prep School		
		11/29/2010	1.75		Auditory Integration Training	Kiddie Prep School		
		11/30/2010	1.75		Neurodevelopment, Reflexes and Learning 1	Kiddie Prep School		
		12/13/2010	0.5		Kindergarten Readiness Part 2	Kiddie Prep School		
		12/13/2010	0.5		Kindergarten Readiness Part 1	Kiddie Prep School		
		1/20/2011	0.75		Going Back to Basics for Quality Care	Kiddie Prep School		
		1/20/2011	2		Assessing Early Childhood Development	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/23/2011	2		Guidance and Discipline in a Child Care Setting	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/24/2011	1		Stages of Cognitive Development in Preschoolers	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/24/2011	1		Science Activities and Young Children	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/24/2011	1		Shaken Baby Syndrome and Sudden Infant Death Syndrome	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/25/2011	1		Encouraging Parent Involvement	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/25/2011	1		Curriculum Development Tools	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/26/2011	2		Assessing Children's Physical Development	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/27/2011	1		Teaching Tolerance	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/27/2011	1		Stages of Cognitive Development in Toddlers	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/27/2011	1		Stages of Social and Emotional Development in Infants	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/27/2011	1		Special Care: Inclusion	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/29/2011	1		Physical Activity for Children with Disabilities	Early Childhood Alliance		
		2/2/2011	2		Positive Solutions for Challenging Behaviors	Early Childhood Alliance		
		2/2/2011	2		Assessing Child Care Programs	Early Childhood Alliance		
		2/2/2011	1		Stages of Social and Emotional Development in Preschoolers	Early Childhood Alliance		
		2/3/2011	2		Stress in Young Children	Early Childhood Alliance		
		2/7/2011	1		Conflict Resolution for Adults	Early Childhood Alliance		
		2/7/2011	1		Discovery of Math	Early Childhood Alliance		
		2/8/2011	1		Stages of Social and Emotional Development in Toddlers	Early Childhood Alliance		
		2/8/2011	1		Multiculturalism	Early Childhood Alliance		
		2/9/2011	1		Documenting Children's Behavior	Early Childhood Alliance		
		2/10/2011	1		Assessing Child Care Business Practices	Early Childhood Alliance		
		2/12/2011	1		Learning Styles Classroom	Early Childhood Alliance		
		2/15/2011	1		Relating with Parents	Early Childhood Alliance		
		2/17/2011	1		Bullying: Identification and Prevention	Early Childhood Alliance		
		2/17/2011	1		Nutrition: Curriculum Development Tools	Early Childhood Alliance		
		2/18/2011	0.75		Review Teachers' Suggestions	Kiddie Prep School		
		2/21/2011	1		Health: Curriculum Development Tools	Early Childhood Alliance		
		2/22/2011	2		Language Development	Early Childhood Alliance		
		2/23/2011	1		Working with Children with Disabilities	Early Childhood Alliance		
		2/24/2011	2		Child Abuse: Physical Abuse Awareness	Early Childhood Alliance		
		3/1/2011	1		Enhancing Children's Self-Esteem	Early Childhood Alliance		
		3/2/2011	1		Environmental Safety	Early Childhood Alliance		
		3/3/2011	0.75		Preparing for Neurodevelopment	Kiddie Prep School		
		3/3/2011	1		Stages of Cognitive Development in Infants	Early Childhood Alliance		
		3/4/2011	1		Physical Activity	Early Childhood Alliance		
		3/5/2011	1		Child Abuse: Sexual Abuse Awareness	Early Childhood Alliance		
		3/6/2011	1		Child Abuse: Identification and Prevention	Early Childhood Alliance		
		3/6/2011	1		Child Abuse: Identification and Prevention	Early Childhood Alliance		
		3/7/2011	0.5		Kindergarten Readiness Part 3	Kiddie Prep School		
		9/22/2010	1.25		Review State and Paths to Quality Requirements	Kiddie Prep School		
		5/17/2011	0.75		Child Abuse & Neglect Indicators	Kiddie Prep School		
		5/31/2011	1		CPR Certification	Kiddie Prep School		
		6/22/2011	1.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #1 Unsalty Salt	Kiddie Prep School		
		6/29/2011	1.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #2 The Biblical Foundation of Prayer	Kiddie Prep School		
		7/7/2011	1		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #3 Above All Else	Kiddie Prep School		
7/13/2011	1.25		Preparing Teachers: #4 Moving the Hand of God-The Holy Spirit	Kiddie Prep School				

Education_Hours_Query 11

Last Name	First Name	Date	Conf.	Credits	Name of Class	Location	Total Conf. Hours	Total Credit Hours
Clifton	Jean	10/5/2010	2		Building Blocks for Families	United Way Agency	25.75	0
		10/21/2010	2		Spotlight on Autism	NACS		
		11/15/2010	1		Movin' to the Music: An Early Literacy Workshop	ACPL		
		11/18/2010	0.75		Communication at Kiddie Prep School	Kiddie Prep School		
		11/18/2010	0.75		"You Pick It" - Updates to Help Team Run Efficiently	Kiddie Prep School		
		11/29/2010	1.75		Auditory Integration Training	Kiddie Prep School		
		11/30/2010	1.75		Neurodevelopment, Reflexes and Learning 1	Kiddie Prep School		
		12/2/2010	1.75		One-Minute Classroom Exercises and Transitional Activities	Kiddie Prep School		
		12/13/2010	0.5		Kindergarten Readiness Part 2	Kiddie Prep School		
		12/13/2010	0.5		Kindergarten Readiness Part 1	Kiddie Prep School		
		1/6/2011	0.75		Technology Rmeinders to Improve Parent Teacher Communication	Kiddie Prep School		
		2/18/2011	0.75		Review Teachers' Suggestions	Kiddie Prep School		
		3/3/2011	0.75		Preparing for Neurodevelopment	Kiddie Prep School		
		3/7/2011	0.5		Kindergarten Readiness Part 3	Kiddie Prep School		
		3/22/2011	1		The Development of Visually Impaired Students	Kiddie Prep School		
		5/17/2011	0.75		Child Abuse & Neglect Indicators	Kiddie Prep School		
		6/23/2011	1.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #1 Unsalty Salt	Kiddie Prep School		
		6/30/2011	1.5		Preparing Teacher for Their Calling: #2 The Biblical Foundation of Prayer	Kiddie Prep School		
		7/7/2011	1		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #3 Above All Else	Kiddie Prep School		
		7/14/2011	1.25		Preparing Teachers: #4 Moving the Hand of God-The Holy Spirit	Kiddie Prep School		
		7/20/2011	1		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #5 Holy Heat	Kiddie Prep School		
		7/28/2011	1.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #6 Prayer, Holiness, and Fire	Kiddie Prep School		
		8/3/2011	0.75		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #7 Beauty for Ashes	Kiddie Prep School		
Cooper	Brandy	8/1/2011	1		First Aid Certification		1	0
Cress	Erin	6/23/2011	1.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #1 Unsalty Salt	Kiddie Prep School	8.5	0
		6/30/2011	1.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #2 Biblical Foundation of Prayer	Kiddie Prep School		
		7/7/2011	1		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #3 Above All Else	Kiddie Prep School		
		7/14/2011	1.25		Preparing Teachers: #4 Moving the Hand of God-The Holy Spirit	Kiddie Prep School		
		7/20/2011	1		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #5 Holy Heat	Kiddie Prep School		
		7/28/2011	1.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #6 Prayer, Holiness, and Fire	Kiddie Prep School		
		8/3/2011	0.75		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #7 Beauty for Ashes	Kiddie Prep School		
Henderson	Karen	9/20/2010	1.25		Review State and Paths to Quality Requirements	Kiddie Prep School	24.75	0
		10/7/2010	0.25		Computer Frustrations	Kiddie Prep School		
		10/7/2010	0.5		Communication with Parents/Laptops	Kiddie Prep School		
		11/15/2010	1		Movin' to the Music: An Early Literacy Workshop	ACPL		
		11/18/2010	0.75		"You Pick It" - Updates to Help Team Run Efficiently	Kiddie Prep School		
		11/18/2010	0.75		Communication at Kiddie Prep School	Kiddie Prep School		
		12/1/2010	1.75		Neurodevelopment, Reflexes and Learning 2	Kiddie Prep School		
		12/2/2010	1.75		One-Minute Classroom Exercises and Transitional Activities	Kiddie Prep School		
		1/6/2011	0.75		Technology Rmeinders to Improve Parent Teacher Communication	Kiddie Prep School		
		1/20/2011	0.75		Going Back to Basics for Quality Care	Kiddie Prep School		
		2/18/2011	0.75		Review Teachers' Suggestions	Kiddie Prep School		
		3/3/2011	0.75		Preparing for Neurodevelopment	Kiddie Prep School		
		3/15/2011	1.75		Neurodevelopment: Foundations for Development & Learning	Kiddie Prep School		
		3/15/2011	1.75		Auditory Integration Training	Kiddie Prep School		
		3/22/2011	1		The Development of Visually Impaired Students	Kiddie Prep School		
		5/17/2011	0.75		Child Abuse & Neglect Indicators	Kiddie Prep School		
		6/23/2011	1.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #1 Unsalty Salt	Kiddie Prep School		
		6/30/2011	1.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #2 Biblical Foundation of Prayer	Kiddie Prep School		
		7/7/2011	1		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #3 Above All Else	Kiddie Prep School		
		7/13/2011	1.25		Preparing Teachers: #4 Moving the Hand of God-The Holy Spirit	Kiddie Prep School		
		7/20/2011	1		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #5 Holy Heat	Kiddie Prep School		
		7/28/2011	1.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #6 Prayer, Holiness, and Fire	Kiddie Prep School		
		8/3/2011	0.75		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #7 Beauty for Ashes	Kiddie Prep School		

Education_Hours_Query 11

Last Name	First Name	Date	Conf.	Credits	Name of Class	Location	Total Conf. Hours	Total Credit Hours				
Hoya	Esther	9/22/2010	1.25		Review State and Paths to Quality Requirements	Kiddie Prep School	12.75	0				
		11/18/2010	0.75		Communication at Kiddie Prep School	Kiddie Prep School						
		11/18/2010	0.75		"You Pick It" - Updates to Help Team Run Efficiently	Kiddie Prep School						
		11/29/2010	1.75		Auditory Integration Training	Kiddie Prep School						
		11/30/2010	1.75		Neurodevelopment, Reflexes and Learning 1	Kiddie Prep School						
		1/6/2011	0.75		Technology Rmeinders to Improve Parent Teacher Communication	Kiddie Prep School						
		1/20/2011	0.75		Going Back to Basics for Quality Care	Kiddie Prep School						
		2/18/2011	0.75		Review Teachers' Suggestions	Kiddie Prep School						
		3/3/2011	0.75		Preparing for Neurodevelopment	Kiddie Prep School						
		3/11/2011	1.75		Neurodevelopment: Foundations for Development & Learning	Kiddie Prep School						
		3/22/2011	1		The Development of Visually Impaired Students	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/17/2011	0.75		Child Abuse & Neglect Indicators	Kiddie Prep School						
		Hughes	Deborah	2/17/2011	2				School Readiness and Hot Topics from the IN Dept of Education	Early Childhood Alliance	7.75	0
				3/18/2011	3				Child Care Resource and Referral	Early Childhood Alliance		
5/17/2011	0.75				Child Abuse & Neglect Indicators	Kiddie Prep School						
5/26/2011	1				CPR Certification	Kiddie Prep School						
6/1/2011	1				Accreditation Commision Member	ACSI Med-America						
Knox	Jessica	9/1/2010		3	ECE 101 Health, Safety, Nutrition	Ivy Tech	25.25	16				
		9/1/2010		1	IVYT 101 First Year Semester	Ivy Tech						
		10/7/2010	0.25		Computer Frustrations	Kiddie Prep School						
		10/7/2010	0.5		Communication with Parents/Laptops	Kiddie Prep School						
		10/10/2010	1.25		Review State and Paths to Quality Requirements	Kiddie Prep School						
		11/18/2010	0.75		"You Pick It" - Updates to Help Team Run Efficiently	Kiddie Prep School						
		11/18/2010	0.75		Communication at Kiddie Prep School	Kiddie Prep School						
		12/1/2010	1.75		Neurodevelopment, Reflexes and Learning 2	Kiddie Prep School						
		12/2/2010	1.75		One-Minute Classroom Exercises and Transitional Activities	Kiddie Prep School						
		12/13/2010	0.5		Kindergarten Readiness Part 1	Kiddie Prep School						
		12/13/2010	0.5		Kindergarten Readiness Part 2	Kiddie Prep School						
		1/1/2011		3	SOCI 111 Introduction to Sociology	Ivy Tech						
		1/1/2011		3	ENGL 111 English Composition	Ivy Tech						
		1/6/2011	0.75		Technology Rmeinders to Improve Parent Teacher Communication	Kiddie Prep School						
		1/20/2011	0.75		Going Back to Basics for Quality Care	Kiddie Prep School						
		2/18/2011	0.75		Review Teachers' Suggestions	Kiddie Prep School						
		3/3/2011	0.75		Preparing for Neurodevelopment	Kiddie Prep School						
		3/7/2011	0.5		Kindergarten Readiness Part 3	Kiddie Prep School						
		3/11/2011	1.75		Auditory Integration Training	Kiddie Prep School						
		3/11/2011	1.75		Neurodevelopment: Foundations for Development & Learning	Kiddie Prep School						
		3/22/2011	1		The Development of Visually Impaired Students	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/17/2011	0.75		Child Abuse & Neglect Indicators	Kiddie Prep School						
		6/1/2011		3	ECE101 Health, Safety and Nutrition	Ivy Tech						
		6/23/2011	1.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #1 Unsalty Salt	Kiddie Prep School						
		6/30/2011	1.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #2 Biblical Foundation of Prayer	Kiddie Prep School						
		7/7/2011	1		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #3 Above All Else	Kiddie Prep School						
		7/14/2011	1.25		Preparing Teachers: #4 Moving the Hand of God-The Holy Spirit	Kiddie Prep School						
		7/20/2011	1		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #5 Holy Heat	Kiddie Prep School						
		7/27/2011	1.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #6 Prayer, Holiness, and Fire	Kiddie Prep School						
		8/3/2011	0.75		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #7 Beauty for Ashes	Kiddie Prep School						
9/1/2011		3	SOC 111: Introduction to Sociology	Ivy Tech								

Education_Hours_Query 11

Last Name	First Name	Date	Conf.	Credits	Name of Class	Location	Total Conf. Hours	Total Credit Hours				
Knox	Karlee	9/20/2010	1.25		Review State and Paths to Quality Requirements	Kiddie Prep School	27.25	6				
		11/18/2010	0.75		Communication at Kiddie Prep School	Kiddie Prep School						
		11/18/2010	0.75		"You Pick It" - Updates to Help Team Run Efficiently	Kiddie Prep School						
		12/1/2010	1.75		Neurodevelopment, Reflexes and Learning 2	Kiddie Prep School						
		12/2/2010	1.75		One-Minute Classroom Exercises and Transitional Activities	Kiddie Prep School						
		1/1/2011		3	MATH 023	Ivy Tech						
		1/1/2011		3	ENGL 031	Ivy Tech						
		1/6/2011	0.75		Technology Rmeinders to Improve Parent Teacher Communication	Kiddie Prep School						
		1/20/2011	0.75		Going Back to Basics for Quality Care	Kiddie Prep School						
		2/18/2011	0.75		Review Teachers' Suggestions	Kiddie Prep School						
		3/3/2011	0.75		Preparing for Neurodevelopment	Kiddie Prep School						
		3/7/2011	0.5		Kindergarten Readiness Part 3	Kiddie Prep School						
		3/11/2011	1.75		Auditory Integration Training	Kiddie Prep School						
		3/11/2011	1.75		Neurodevelopment: Foundations for Development & Learning	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/17/2011	0.75		Child Abuse & Neglect Indicators	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/18/2011	1.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #1 Unsalty Salt	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/19/2011	1.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #2 The Biblical Foundation of Prayer	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/20/2011	1		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #3 Above All Else	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/24/2011	1.25		Preparing Teachers: #4 Moving the Hand of God-The Holy Spirit	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/25/2011	1		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #5 Holy Heat	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/26/2011	1.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #6 Prayer, Holiness, and Fire	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/26/2011	1		CPR Certification	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/27/2011	0.75		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #7 Beauty for Ashes	Kiddie Prep School						
		6/2/2011	2.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #8 Q&A with Pastors and Prayer	Kiddie Prep School						
		6/3/2011	1.25		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #9 Fight Fire with Fire	Kiddie Prep School						
		Mays	Ryan	9/1/2010	2				Curriculum Development and Planning Part 2	Kiddie Prep School	39.75	0
				9/1/2010	2				Curriculum Development and Planning Part 1	Kiddie Prep School		
				9/20/2010	1.25				Review State and Paths to Quality Requirements	Kiddie Prep School		
				10/7/2010	0.25				Computer Frustrations	Kiddie Prep School		
				11/18/2010	0.75				"You Pick It" - Updates to Help Team Run Efficiently	Kiddie Prep School		
11/18/2010	0.75				Communication at Kiddie Prep School	Kiddie Prep School						
12/2/2010	1.75				One-Minute Classroom Exercises and Transitional Activities	Kiddie Prep School						
12/13/2010	0.5				Kindergarten Readiness Part 1	Kiddie Prep School						
12/13/2010	0.5				Kindergarten Readiness Part 2	Kiddie Prep School						
1/6/2011	0.75				Technology Rmeinders to Improve Parent Teacher Communication	Kiddie Prep School						
1/20/2011	0.75				Going Back to Basics for Quality Care	Kiddie Prep School						
2/18/2011	0.75				Review Teachers' Suggestions	Kiddie Prep School						
3/3/2011	0.75				Preparing for Neurodevelopment	Kiddie Prep School						
3/7/2011	0.5				Kindergarten Readiness Part 3	Kiddie Prep School						
3/15/2011	1.75				Auditory Integration Training	Kiddie Prep School						
3/15/2011	1.75				Neurodevelopment: Foundations for Development & Learning	Kiddie Prep School						
3/22/2011	1				The Development of Visually Impaired Students	Kiddie Prep School						
5/17/2011	0.75				Child Abuse & Neglect Indicators	Kiddie Prep School						
5/18/2011	1.5				Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #1 Unsalty Salt	Kiddie Prep School						
5/19/2011	1.5				Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #2 The Biblical Foundation of Prayer	Kiddie Prep School						
5/20/2011	1				Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #3 Above All Else	Kiddie Prep School						
5/24/2011	1.25				Preparing Teachers: #4 Moving the Hand of God-The Holy Spirit	Kiddie Prep School						
5/25/2011	1				Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #5 Holy Heat	Kiddie Prep School						
5/26/2011	1				CPR Certification	Kiddie Prep School						
5/26/2011	1.5				Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #6 Prayer, Holiness, and Fire	Kiddie Prep School						
5/27/2011	0.75				Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #7 Beauty for Ashes	Kiddie Prep School						
5/30/2011	1				Relating with Parents	Early Childhood Alliance						
5/30/2011	1				Environmental Safety	Early Childhood Alliance						
5/30/2011	1				Physical Activity	Early Childhood Alliance						
6/2/2011	2.5				Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #8 Q&A with Pastors and Prayer	Kiddie Prep School						
6/3/2011	1.25		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #9 Fight Fire with Fire	Kiddie Prep School								
6/19/2011	2		Positive Solutions for Challenging Behavior	Early Childhood Alliance Online								
6/26/2011	1		Discovery of Math	Early Childhood Alliance Online								
6/26/2011	1		Science Activities and Youn Children	Early Childhood Alliance Online								
6/26/2011	1		Physical Activity for Children with Disabilities	Early Childhood Alliance Online								

Education_Hours_Query 11

Last Name	First Name	Date	Conf.	Credits	Name of Class	Location	Total Conf. Hours	Total Credit Hours				
McCloskey	Madison	7/19/2011	2.25		New Staff Child Development Video #1: Units 1-4	Kiddie Prep School	7.75	0				
		7/19/2011	2.25		New Staff Child Development Video #2: Units 5-9	Kiddie Prep School						
		7/20/2011	1		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #5 Holy Heat	Kiddie Prep School						
		7/27/2011	1.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #6 Prayer, Holiness, and Fire	Kiddie Prep School						
		8/3/2011	0.75		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #7 Beauty for Ashes	Kiddie Prep School						
Palma	Griselda	9/1/2010	4		Partnering with Families: Reducing Young Children's Challenging Behaviors	Early Childhood Alliance	21	3				
		9/20/2010	1.25		Review State and Paths to Quality Requirements	Kiddie Prep School						
		10/7/2010	0.5		Communication with Parents/Laptops	Kiddie Prep School						
		10/7/2010	0.25		Computer Frustrations	Kiddie Prep School						
		11/15/2010	1		Movin' to the Music: An Early Literacy Workshop	ACPL						
		11/18/2010	0.75		"You Pick It" - Updates to Help Team Run Efficiently	Kiddie Prep School						
		11/18/2010	0.75		Communication at Kiddie Prep School	Kiddie Prep School						
		11/29/2010	1.75		Auditory Integration Training	Kiddie Prep School						
		11/30/2010	1.75		Neurodevelopment, Reflexes and Learning 1	Kiddie Prep School						
		1/6/2011	0.75		Technology Rmeinders to Improve Parent Teacher Communication	Kiddie Prep School						
		1/20/2011	0.75		Going Back to Basics for Quality Care	Kiddie Prep School						
		3/3/2011	0.75		Preparing for Neurodevelopment	Kiddie Prep School						
		3/22/2011	1		The Development of Visually Impaired Students	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/17/2011	0.75		Child Abuse & Neglect Indicators	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/18/2011	1.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #1 Unsalty Salt	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/19/2011	1.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #2 The Biblical Foundation of Prayer	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/20/2011	1		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #3 Above All Else	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/26/2011	1		CPR Certification	Kiddie Prep School						
		9/1/2011		3	IVYT 120: New Student Seminar	Ivy Tech						
		Reid	Janelle	11/18/2010	0.75				Communication at Kiddie Prep School	Kiddie Prep School	16.5	0
12/1/2010	1.75				Neurodevelopment, Reflexes and Learning 2	Kiddie Prep School						
12/2/2010	1.75				One-Minute Classroom Exercises and Transitional Activities	Kiddie Prep School						
2/18/2011	0.75				Review Teachers' Suggestion	Kiddie Prep School						
3/3/2011	0.75				Preparing for Neurodevelopment	Kiddie Prep School						
3/11/2011	1.75				Neurodevelopment: Foundations for Development & Learning	Kiddie Prep School						
3/11/2011	1.75				Auditory Integration Training	Kiddie Prep School						
3/22/2011	1				The Development of Visually Impaired Students	Kiddie Prep School						
5/31/2011	1				CPR Certification	Kiddie Prep School						
7/1/2011	1.5				Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #1 Unsalty Salt	Kiddie Prep School						
7/1/2011	1.5				Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #2 The Biblical Foundation of Prayer	Kiddie Prep School						
8/5/2011	1				Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #3 Above All Else	Kiddie Prep School						
8/5/2011	1.25				Preparing Teachers: #4 Moving the Hand of God-The Holy Spirit	Kiddie Prep School						
Shock	Erin			3/3/2011	1		First Aid Certification	Kiddie Prep School	39.75	0		
				3/3/2011	0.75		Preparing for Neurodevelopment	Kiddie Prep School				
		3/11/2011	1.75		Neurodevelopment: Foundations for Development & Learning	Kiddie Prep School						
		3/11/2011	1.75		Auditory Integration Training	Kiddie Prep School						
		3/22/2011	1		The Development of Visually Impaired Students	Kiddie Prep School						
		3/20/2011	0.5		Annual Notice of the KSP Personnel Policy Manual	Kiddie Prep School						
		3/20/2011	0.75		Child Abuse & Neglect Indicators	Kiddie Prep School						
		3/20/2011	1		Teacher Handbook Training	Kiddie Prep School						
		4/8/2011	3		KPS Training Manual	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/14/2011	1		CACFP Training	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/17/2011	0.75		Child Abuse & Neglect Indicators	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/18/2011	3		Foundations Training	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/23/2011	2.25		New Staff Child Development Video #1: Units 1-4	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/23/2011	2.25		New Staff Child Development Video #3: Units 10-13	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/23/2011	2.25		New Staff Child Development Video #2: Units 5-9	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/25/2011	2.25		New Staff Child Development Video #4: Units 14-17	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/25/2011	2.25		New Staff Child Development Video #6: Units 22-26	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/25/2011	2.25		New Staff Child Development Video #5: Units 18-21	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/27/2011	1.5		New Staff Child Development Video #7: Units 27-30	Kiddie Prep School						
		6/23/2011	1.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #1 Unsalty Salt	Kiddie Prep School						
		6/30/2011	1.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #2 Biblical Foundation of Prayer	Kiddie Prep School						
		7/6/2011	1		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #3 Above All Else	Kiddie Prep School						
		7/14/2011	1.25		Preparing Teachers: #4 Moving the Hand of God-The Holy Spirit	Kiddie Prep School						
		7/20/2011	1		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #5 Holy Heat	Kiddie Prep School						
		7/28/2011	1.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #6 Prayer, Holiness, and Fire	Kiddie Prep School						
		8/3/2011	0.75		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #7 Beauty for Ashes	Kiddie Prep School						

Education_Hours_Query 11

Last Name	First Name	Date	Conf.	Credits	Name of Class	Location	Total Conf. Hours	Total Credit Hours				
Sicard	Nicole	9/1/2010		5	MATH 015: Fundamentals of Algebra I	Ivy Tech	22.5	14				
		9/22/2010	1.25		Review State and Paths to Quality Requirements	Kiddie Prep School						
		10/7/2010	0.25		Computer Frustrations	Kiddie Prep School						
		10/7/2010	0.5		Communication with Parents/Laptops	Kiddie Prep School						
		11/18/2010	0.75		Communication at Kiddie Prep School	Kiddie Prep School						
		11/18/2010	0.75		"You Pick It" - Updates to Help Team Run Efficiently	Kiddie Prep School						
		12/1/2010	1.75		Neurodevelopment, Reflexes and Learning 2	Kiddie Prep School						
		12/2/2010	1.75		One-Minute Classroom Exercises and Transitional Activities	Kiddie Prep School						
		1/1/2011		3	ECE 243 Cognitive Curriculum	Ivy Tech						
		1/1/2011		3	ECE 204 Families in Transition	Ivy Tech						
		1/6/2011	0.75		Technology Rmeinders to Improve Parent Teacher Communication	Kiddie Prep School						
		1/20/2011	0.75		Going Back to Basics for Quality Care	Kiddie Prep School						
		2/18/2011	0.75		Review Teachers' Suggestions	Kiddie Prep School						
		3/3/2011	0.75		Preparing for Neurodevelopment	Kiddie Prep School						
		3/16/2011	1.75		Neurodevelopment: Foundation for Development & Learning	Kiddie Prep School						
		3/16/2011	1.75		Auditory Integration Training	Kiddie Prep School						
		3/22/2011	1		The Development of Visually Impaired Students	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/17/2011	0.75		Child Abuse & Neglect Indicators	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/26/2011	1		CPR Certification	Kiddie Prep School						
		6/1/2011		3	FITN 100-81G Lifetime Fitness and Wellness	Ivy Tech						
		6/22/2011	1.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #1 Unsalty Salt	Kiddie Prep School						
		7/13/2011	1.25		Preparing Teachers: #4 Moving the Hand of God-The Holy Spirit	Kiddie Prep School						
		7/20/2011	1		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #5 Holy Heat	Kiddie Prep School						
		7/29/2011	1		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #3 Above All Else	Kiddie Prep School						
		7/29/2011	1.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #2 Biblical Foundation of Prayer	Kiddie Prep School						
		Skibinski	Denise	9/20/2010	1.25				Review State and Paths to Quality Requirements	Kiddie Prep School	28.5	0
				10/7/2010	0.5				Communication with Parents/Laptops	Kiddie Prep School		
				10/7/2010	0.25				Computer Frustrations	Kiddie Prep School		
10/21/2010	2				Spotlight on Autism	NACS						
11/18/2010	0.75				Communication at Kiddie Prep School	Kiddie Prep School						
11/18/2010	0.75				"You Pick It" - Updates to Help Team Run Efficiently	Kiddie Prep School						
11/29/2010	1.75				Auditory Integration Training	Kiddie Prep School						
11/30/2010	1.75				Neurodevelopment, Reflexes and Learning 1	Kiddie Prep School						
12/13/2010	0.5				Kindergarten Readiness Part 2	Kiddie Prep School						
12/13/2010	0.5				Kindergarten Readiness Part 1	Kiddie Prep School						
1/6/2011	0.75				Technology Rmeinders to Improve Parent Teacher Communication	Kiddie Prep School						
1/20/2011	0.75				Going Back to Basics for Quality Care	Kiddie Prep School						
2/18/2011	0.75				Review Teachers' Suggestions	Kiddie Prep School						
3/3/2011	0.75				Preparing for Neurodevelopment	Kiddie Prep School						
3/7/2011	0.5				Kindergarten Readiness Part 3	Kiddie Prep School						
3/22/2011	1				The Development of Visually Impaired Students	Kiddie Prep School						
5/17/2011	0.75				Child Abuse & Neglect Indicators	Kiddie Prep School						
5/18/2011	1.5				Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #1 Unsalty Salt	Kiddie Prep School						
5/19/2011	1.5				Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #2 The Biblical Foundation of Prayer	Kiddie Prep School						
5/20/2011	1				Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #3 Above All Else	Kiddie Prep School						
5/24/2011	1.25				Preparing Teachers: #4 Moving the Hand of God-The Holy Spirit	Kiddie Prep School						
5/25/2011	1				Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #5 Holy Heat	Kiddie Prep School						
5/26/2011	1.5				Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #6 Prayer, Holiness, and Fire	Kiddie Prep School						
5/26/2011	1				CPR Certification	Kiddie Prep School						
5/27/2011	0.75				Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #7 Beauty for Ashes	Kiddie Prep School						
6/2/2011	2.5				Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #8 Q&A with Pastors and Prayer	Kiddie Prep School						
6/3/2011	1.25				Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #9 Fight Fire with Fire	Kiddie Prep School						

Education_Hours_Query 11

Last Name	First Name	Date	Conf.	Credits	Name of Class	Location	Total Conf. Hours	Total Credit Hours
Tam-Akins	Chris	9/20/2010	1.25		Review State and Paths to Quality Requirements	Kiddie Prep School	58	0
		10/7/2010	0.5		Communication with Parents/Laptops	Kiddie Prep School		
		10/7/2010	0.25		Computer Frustrations	Kiddie Prep School		
		11/18/2010	0.75		Communication at Kiddie Prep School	Kiddie Prep School		
		11/18/2010	0.75		"You Pick It" - Updates to Help Team Run Efficiently	Kiddie Prep School		
		12/1/2010	1.75		Neurodevelopment, Reflexes and Learning 2	Kiddie Prep School		
		12/2/2010	1.75		One-Minute Classroom Exercises and Transitional Activities	Kiddie Prep School		
		12/13/2010	0.5		Kindergarten Readiness Part 1	Kiddie Prep School		
		12/13/2010	0.5		Kindergarten Readiness Part 2	Kiddie Prep School		
		1/3/2011	1		Stages of Social and Emotional Development in Infants	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/3/2011	1		Teaching Tolerance	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/4/2011	1		Positive Solutions for Challenging Behaviors	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/4/2011	1		Physical Activity for Children with Disabilities	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/5/2011	1		Child Abuse: Identification and Prevention	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/5/2011	1		Enhancing Children's Self-Esteem	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/6/2011	1		Safety: Curriculum Development Tools	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/6/2011	1		Stages of Cognitive Development in Infants	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/6/2011	1		Science Activities and Young Children	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/7/2011	1		Health: Curriculum Development Tools	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/9/2011	1		Conflict Resolution for Adults	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/9/2011	1		Working with Children with Disabilities	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/9/2011	1		Documenting Children's Behavior	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/10/2011	1		Nutrition: Curriculum Development Tools	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/10/2011	1		Bullying: Identification and Prevention	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/12/2011	1		Assessing Child Care Business Practices	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/13/2011	1		Child Abuse: Physical Abuse Awareness	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/14/2011	1		Special Care: Inclusion	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/17/2011	1		Encouraging Parental Involvement	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/18/2011	1		Physical Activity	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/18/2011	1		Shaken Baby Syndrome and Sudden Infant Death Syndrome	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/19/2011	1		Stages of Cognitive Development in Preschoolers	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/19/2011	1		Relating with Parents	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/20/2011	0.75		Going Back to Basics for Quality Care	Kiddie Prep School		
		1/22/2011	1		Multiculturalism Classroom	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/22/2011	1		Child Abuse: Sexual Abuse Awareness	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/23/2011	1		Learning Styles Classroom	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/24/2011	1		Environmental Safety Classroom	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/25/2011	1		Stages of Social and Emotional Development in Preschoolers	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/25/2011	2		Language Development	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/26/2011	1		Stages of Cognitive Development Toddlers	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/26/2011	1		Stress in Young Children	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/27/2011	1		Stages of Social and Emotional Development in Toddlers	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/28/2011	2		Assessing Children's Physical Development	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/29/2011	1		Discovery of Math	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/29/2011	2		Assessing Early Childhood Development	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/29/2011	2		Assessing Child Care Programs	Early Childhood Alliance		
		1/30/2011	2		Guidance and Discipline in a Child Care Setting	Early Childhood Alliance		
		2/18/2011	0.75		Review Teachers' Suggestions	Kiddie Prep School		
		3/3/2011	0.75		Preparing for Neurodevelopment	Kiddie Prep School		
		3/7/2011	0.5		Kindergarten Readiness Part 3	Kiddie Prep School		
		3/17/2011	1.75		Neurodevelopment: Foundation for Development & Learning	Kiddie Prep School		
3/17/2011	1.75		Auditory Integration Training	Kiddie Prep School				
3/22/2011	1		The Development of Visually Impaired Students	Kiddie Prep School				
5/17/2011	0.75		Child Abuse & Neglect Indicators	Kiddie Prep School				

Education_Hours_Query 11

Last Name	First Name	Date	Conf.	Credits	Name of Class	Location	Total Conf. Hours	Total Credit Hours				
Thomas	Cheryl	9/1/2010		3	ECE 120: Child Growth and Development	Ivy Tech	22.25	9				
		9/20/2010	1.25		Review State and Paths to Quality Requirements	Kiddie Prep School						
		10/7/2010	0.25		Computer Frustrations	Kiddie Prep School						
		10/7/2010	0.5		Communication with Parents/Laptops	Kiddie Prep School						
		11/18/2010	0.75		Communication at Kiddie Prep School	Kiddie Prep School						
		11/18/2010	0.75		You Pick It - Updates to Help Team Run Efficiently	Kiddie Prep School						
		12/1/2010	1.75		Neurodevelopment, Reflexes and Learning 2	Kiddie Prep School						
		12/2/2010	1.75		One-Minute Classroom Exercises and Transitional Activities	Kiddie Prep School						
		1/1/2011		3	ECE 130 Dev. Approp. Guidance in Cult. Context	Ivy Tech						
		1/6/2011	0.75		Technology Reminders to Improve Parent Teacher Communication	Kiddie Prep School						
		1/20/2011	0.75		Going Back to Basics for Quality Care	Kiddie Prep School						
		2/18/2011	0.75		Review Teachers' Suggestions	Kiddie Prep School						
		3/3/2011	0.75		Preparing for Neurodevelopment	Kiddie Prep School						
		3/16/2011	1.75		Auditory Integration Training	Kiddie Prep School						
		3/16/2011	1.75		Neurodevelopment: Foundation for Development & Learning	Kiddie Prep School						
		3/22/2011	1		The Development of Visually Impaired Students	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/17/2011	0.75		Child Abuse & Neglect Indicators	Kiddie Prep School						
		7/6/2011	1		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #3 Above All Else	Kiddie Prep School						
		7/13/2011	1.25		Preparing Teachers: #4 Moving the Hand of God-The Holy Spirit	Kiddie Prep School						
		7/20/2011	1		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #5 Holy Heat	Kiddie Prep School						
		7/27/2011	1.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #6 Prayer, Holiness, and Fire	Kiddie Prep School						
		7/29/2011	1.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #2 Biblical Foundation of Prayer	Kiddie Prep School						
		8/1/2011		3	ECED 111: Environment Infant & Toddler	Ivy Tech						
		8/3/2011	0.75		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #7 Beauty for Ashes	Kiddie Prep School						
		Vitek	Kiley	10/1/2010	1				Teacher Handbook Training	Kiddie Prep School	42	0
				10/1/2010	2.25				New Staff Child Development Video #2: Units 5-9	Kiddie Prep School		
				10/1/2010	2.25				New Staff Child Development Video #1: Units 1-4	Kiddie Prep School		
				10/1/2010	0.5				Annual Notice of The KPS Personnel Policy Manual	Kiddie Prep School		
				10/15/2010	0.75				Child Abuse & Neglect Indicators	Kiddie Prep School		
				10/29/2010	2.25				New Staff Child Development Video #3: Units 10-13	Kiddie Prep School		
11/1/2010	0.5				CACFP Training	Kiddie Prep School						
11/1/2010	2.25				New Staff Child Development Video #5: Units 18-21	Kiddie Prep School						
11/1/2010	2.25				New Staff Child Development Video #4: Units 14-17	Kiddie Prep School						
11/2/2010	2.25				New Staff Child Development Video #6: Units 22-26	Kiddie Prep School						
11/3/2010	1.5				New Staff Child Development Video #7: Units 27-30	Kiddie Prep School						
11/8/2010	3				KPS Training Manual	Kiddie Prep School						
11/18/2010	0.75				Communication at Kiddie Prep School	Kiddie Prep School						
11/18/2010	0.75				"You Pick It" - Updates to Help Team Run Efficiently	Kiddie Prep School						
1/6/2011	0.75				Technology Rmeinders to Improve Parent Teacher Communication	Kiddie Prep School						
1/20/2011	0.75				Going Back to Basics for Quality Care	Kiddie Prep School						
2/18/2011	0.75				Review Teachers' Suggestions	Kiddie Prep School						
3/3/2011	0.75				Preparing for Neurodevelopment	Kiddie Prep School						
3/17/2011	1.75				Neurodevelopment: Foundation for Development & Learning	Kiddie Prep School						
3/17/2011	1.75				Auditory Integration Training	Kiddie Prep School						
3/22/2011	1				The Development of Visually Impaired Students	Kiddie Prep School						
5/17/2011	0.75				Child Abuse & Neglect Indicators	Kiddie Prep School						
5/18/2011	3				Foundations Training	Kiddie Prep School						
6/22/2011	1.5				Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #1 Unsalty Salt	Kiddie Prep School						
6/29/2011	1.5				Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #2 The Biblical Foundation of Prayer	Kiddie Prep School						
7/6/2011	1				Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #3 Above All Else	Kiddie Prep School						
7/13/2011	1.25				Preparing Teachers: #4 Moving the Hand of God-The Holy Spirit	Kiddie Prep School						
7/20/2011	1				Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #5 Holy Heat	Kiddie Prep School						
7/27/2011	1.5				Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #6 Prayer, Holiness, and Fire	Kiddie Prep School						
8/3/2011	0.75				Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #7 Beauty for Ashes	Kiddie Prep School						

Education_Hours_Query 11

Last Name	First Name	Date	Conf.	Credits	Name of Class	Location	Total Conf. Hours	Total Credit Hours				
Williams	Shayla	2/3/2011	1		First Aid Certification	Kiddie Prep School	37	0				
		2/13/2011	0.5		CACFP Training	Kiddie Prep School						
		2/14/2011	3		KPS Training Manual	Kiddie Prep School						
		2/14/2011	1		Teacher Handbook Training	Kiddie Prep School						
		2/14/2011	0.75		Child Abuse & Neglect Indicators	Kiddie Prep School						
		2/15/2011	0.5		Annual Notice of The KPS Personnel Policy Manual	Kiddie Prep School						
		2/17/2011	2.25		New Staff Child Development Video #1: Units 1-4	Kiddie Prep School						
		2/17/2011	2.25		New Staff Child Development Video #2: Units 5-9	Kiddie Prep School						
		2/17/2011	2.25		New Staff Child Development Video #3: Units 10-13	Kiddie Prep School						
		2/18/2011	0.75		Review Teachers' Suggestions	Kiddie Prep School						
		3/3/2011	0.75		Preparing for Neurodevelopment	Kiddie Prep School						
		3/17/2011	1.75		Neurodevelopment: Foundation for Development & Learning	Kiddie Prep School						
		3/17/2011	1.75		Auditory Integration Training	Kiddie Prep School						
		3/22/2011	1		The Development of Visually Impaired Students	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/17/2011	0.75		Child Abuse & Neglect Indicators	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/31/2011	2.25		New Staff Child Development Video #5: Units 18-21	Kiddie Prep School						
		5/31/2011	2.25		New Staff Child Development Video #4: Units 14-17	Kiddie Prep School						
		6/1/2011	1.5		New Staff Child Development Video #7: Units 18-21	Kiddie Prep School						
		6/1/2011	2.25		New Staff Child Development Video #6: Units 22-26	Kiddie Prep School						
		6/22/2011	1.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #1 Unsalty Salt	Kiddie Prep School						
		6/29/2011	1.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #2 The Biblical Foundation of Prayer	Kiddie Prep School						
		7/6/2011	1		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #3 Above All Else	Kiddie Prep School						
		7/13/2011	1.25		Preparing Teachers: #4 Moving the Hand of God-The Holy Spirit	Kiddie Prep School						
		7/20/2011	1		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #5 Holy Heat	Kiddie Prep School						
		7/27/2011	1.5		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #6 Prayer, Holiness, and Fire	Kiddie Prep School						
		8/3/2011	0.75		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #7 Beauty for Ashes	Kiddie Prep School						
		Zirkebach	Daria	9/1/2010		5			MATH 015 Fundamentals of Algebra I	Ivy Tech	19	11
				9/22/2010	1.25				Review State and Paths to Quality Requirements	Kiddie Prep School		
				10/7/2010	0.5				Communication with Parents/Laptops	Kiddie Prep School		
				10/7/2010	0.25				Computer Frustrations	Kiddie Prep School		
11/18/2010	0.75				Communication at Kiddie Prep School	Kiddie Prep School						
11/18/2010	0.75				"You Pick It" - Updates to Help Team Run Efficiently	Kiddie Prep School						
11/29/2010	1.75				Auditory Integration Training	Kiddie Prep School						
11/30/2010	1.75				Neurodevelopment, Reflexes and Learning 1	Kiddie Prep School						
1/1/2011				3	ECE 101 Health, Safety, Nutrition	Ivy Tech						
1/6/2011	0.75				Technology Reminders to Improve Parent Teacher Communication	Kiddie Prep School						
1/20/2011	0.75				Going Back to Basics for Quality Care	Kiddie Prep School						
3/3/2011	0.75				Preparing for Neurodevelopment	Kiddie Prep School						
3/7/2011	0.5				Kindergarten Readiness Part 3	Kiddie Prep School						
5/17/2011	0.75				Child Abuse & Neglect Indicators	Kiddie Prep School						
6/22/2011	1.5				Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #1 Unsalty Salt	Kiddie Prep School						
6/29/2011	1.5				Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #2 The Biblical Foundation of Prayer	Kiddie Prep School						
7/13/2011	1.25				Preparing Teachers: #4 Moving the Hand of God-The Holy Spirit	Kiddie Prep School						
7/20/2011	1				Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #5 Holy Heat	Kiddie Prep School						
7/27/2011	1.5				Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #6 Prayer, Holiness, and Fire	Kiddie Prep School						
8/1/2011				3	ECED 103: Curriculum Early Childhood	Ivy Tech						
8/2/2011	1		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #3 Above All Else	Kiddie Prep School								
8/3/2011	0.75		Preparing Teachers for Their Calling: #7 Beauty for Ashes	Kiddie Prep School								